
TCEQ Interoffice Memorandum 

 

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
 

TO:        Office of the Chief Clerk          
  Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
 
THRU:  Chris Kozlowski, Team Leader 
  Water Rights Permitting Team 
   
FROM: Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager 
  Water Rights Permitting Team 
 
DATE:  June 3, 2022 

 
SUBJECT: River Haven 2, LLC 
  ADJ 4329 

CN605954171, RN106211899 
Application No. 12-4329A to Amend Certificate of Adjudication  

No. 12-4329 
  Texas Water Code § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice 

Brazos River, Brazos River Basin  
  McLennan County  
 
The application and fees were received on April 4, 2022. Additional fees were 
received on May 27, 2022. The application was declared administratively complete 
and accepted for filing with the Office of the Chief Clerk on June 3, 2022.  
Interjacent notice to water right holders of record in the Brazos River Basin is 
required pursuant to Title 30 Texas Administrative Code (TAC) § 295.158(c)(3)(D) 
and notice to co-owners of Certificate of Adjudication No. 12-4329 is required 
pursuant to Title 30 TAC § 295.158(c)(2)(B).  
 
All fees have been paid and the application is sufficient for filing. 
 
 
 
_________________________                                                                                                                      
Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager  
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

OCC Mailed Notice Required   □ YES     □ NO 



Jon Niermann, Chairman 

Emily Lindley, Commissioner 

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Toby Baker, Executive Director 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service?     tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

June 3, 2022 

Mr. Richard George VIA E-MAIL
Enviro-Ag Engineering, Inc. 
9855 FM 847 
Dublin, Texas 76446 

RE: River Haven 2, LLC 
ADJ 4329 
CN605954171, RN106211899 
Application No. 12-4329A to Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 
12-4329 Texas Water Code § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice
Brazos River, Brazos River Basin
McLennan County

Dear Mr. George: 

This acknowledges receipt, on May 27, 2022, of additional fees in the amount of $32.34 (Receipt 
No. M217600, copy attached). 

The application was declared administratively complete and filed with the Office of the Chief 
Clerk on June 3, 2022.  Staff will continue processing the application for consideration by the 
Executive Director. 

Please be advised that additional information may be requested during the technical review 
phase of the application process. 

If you have any questions concerning the application, please contact me via email at 
hal.bailey@tceq.texas.gov or at (512) 239-4615. 

Sincerely, 

Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager  
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 

Attachment 



Basis2 - Receipt History Report

31-MAY-22 09:04 AM

Report_ID: Page 1 of 1

-$32.34

BS00095085

Bank Slip#

D2802769

Document#

Closed

Slip Status

RS

Site Code Created By

27-MAY-22

Tran.Date

N

Tran.Code

M217600

Endorse #

ADJ124329A

Permit/Proj #

-$32.34

Orig Tran Amnt

-$32.34

Corrected Tran Amnt

Corrected?

WUP

Account #

WUP

Fee Code

WATER USE 

PERMITS

Account Name

PATTERSON, 

BARDEN 

TODD/AMY E

Paid In By

052722

Endorse.Date

1997

Check Number

Grand Total:

USAS Proj #

CK

Vendor #

Pay Type

Paid For



1

Hal Bailey

From: Richard George < >
Sent: Monday, May 23, 2022 2:48 PM
To: Hal Bailey
Cc: Chris Kozlowski
Subject: RE: River Haven 2, LLC Application No. 12-4329A RFI

Thank you Hal, I forwarded it to Mr. Patterson for payment submittal. 
  
Richard 
  

From: Hal Bailey <Hal.Bailey@tceq.texas.gov>  
Sent: Monday, May 23, 2022 2:34 PM 
To: Richard George < > 
Cc: Chris Kozlowski <chris.kozlowski@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: River Haven 2, LLC Application No. 12-4329A RFI 
  
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of Enviro-Ag Engineering. Do not click links or open attachments unless you have 
verified the sender and know the content is safe. 
  
Good afternoon Mr. George, 
  
Attached is a Request for Information (RFI) letter for application no. 12-4329A.  
  
Please provide the requested additional fees by COB on 06/22/2022. 
  
Should you have any questions, please let me know. 
  
Thank you, 
  
Hal E. Bailey, Jr. 
Natural Resources Specialist III 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Availability Division 
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
512-239-4615  Hal.Bailey@tceq.texas.gov  
  
  
 

Disclaimer 

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the recipient and 
others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or 
taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. 
 
This email has been scanned for viruses and malware, and may have been automatically archived by Mimecast Ltd, an innovator in 
Software as a Service (SaaS) for business. Providing a safer and more useful place for your human generated data. Specializing in; 
Security, archiving and compliance. To find out more Click Here. 



 

Jon Niermann, Chairman 

Emily Lindley, Commissioner 

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Toby Baker, Executive Director  

 TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service?     tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

May 18, 2022 
 
Mr. Richard George                                                      VIA E-MAIL  
Enviro-Ag Engineering, Inc. 
9855 FM 847 
Dublin, Texas 76446 
 
RE: River Haven 2, LLC 
 ADJ 4329 

CN605954171, RN106211899 
 Application No. 12-4329A to Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 12-4329 
 Texas Water Code § 11.122, Limited Mailed Notice Required 

Brazos River, Brazos River Basin  
 McLennan County  
 
Dear Mr. George: 
 
This acknowledges receipt, on April 4, 2022, of the referenced application and fees in the 
amount of $112.50 (Receipt No. M215561, copy attached).  
 
Before the application can be declared administratively complete, please remit additional fees 
in the amount of $32.34 as described below. Please make checks payable to the TCEQ or Texas 
Commission on Environmental Quality. 
 

Filing Fee (Amendment) $        100.00 
Recording Fee  $          12.50 
Notice ($2.94 x 11 water right holders)  $          32.34 

Total Fees $        144.84 
Fees Received $        112.50 

Fees Due $          32.34 
 

Please provide the requested fees by June 17, 2022, or the application may be returned 
pursuant to Title 30 TAC § 281.18. 
 
If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me via email at 
hal.bailey@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-4615. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
 
Attachment 


































































































































































































































