
TCEQ Interoffice Memorandum 

 

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
 

TO:  Office of the Chief Clerk          
  Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
 
THRU:  Chris Kozlowski, Team Leader 
  Water Rights Permitting Team 
   
FROM: Joshua Schauer, Project Manager 
  Water Rights Permitting Team 
 
DATE:  November 10, 2021 

 
SUBJECT: Natural Dairy Grower Land, LP 
  ADJ 2814 
  CN604321364, RN106506710 

Application No. 12-2814C to Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 12-   
      2814 
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Limited Mailed Notice Required 
Multiple tributaries of the Leon River and the Leon River, Brazos River  
      Basin 

  Comanche County 
 

The application and partial fees were received on August 17, 2021. Additional 
information and fees were received on October 14 and October 26, 2021. The 
application was declared administratively complete and accepted for filing with the 
Office of the Chief Clerk on November 10, 2021. Limited mailed notice is required 
pursuant to Title 30 Texas Administrative Code § 295.158(c)(3)(D). 

 
 
All fees have been paid and the application is sufficient for filing. 
 
 
 
___________________________                                                                                                                      
Joshua Schauer, Project Manager  
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section  
 
 
 
 
 
 

OCC Mailed Notice Required    □YES  □NO 



 

Jon Niermann, Chairman 

Emily Lindley, Commissioner 

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Toby Baker, Executive Director  

 TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service?     tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

November 10, 2021 
 
 
Mr. Richard George           E-MAIL 
Enviro-Ag Engineering, Inc. 
9855 FM 847 
Dublin, Texas 76446 
 
RE: Natural Dairy Grower Land, LP 
 ADJ 2814 
 CN604321364, RN106506710 

Application No. 12-2814C to Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 12-2814 
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Limited Mailed Notice Required 

 Multiple tributaries of the Leon River and the Leon River, Brazos River Basin 
 Comanche County 
 
Dear Mr. George: 
 
This acknowledges receipt, on October 14 and October 26, 2021, of additional information and 
fees in the amount of $108.78 (Receipt No. M202135, copy attached). 
 
The application was declared administratively complete and filed with the Office of the Chief 
Clerk on November 10, 2021.  Staff will continue processing the application for consideration 
by the Executive Director. 
 
Please be advised that additional information may be requested during the technical review 
phase of the application process. 
 
If you have any questions concerning the application, please contact me via email at 
Joshua.Schauer@tceq.texas.gov or at (512) 239-1371. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
Joshua Schauer, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
 
Attachment 
 





From: Richard George
To: Joshua Schauer
Cc: Corey Mullin
Subject: RE: Natural Dairy Land Growers; 14-2814C RFI
Date: Thursday, October 14, 2021 3:53:04 PM
Attachments: image001.png

Ok, that was a mistake--please disregard that.  Off-channel storage is not proposed as part of this amendment
application.
 
Thanks,
Richard
 

From: Joshua Schauer <Joshua.Schauer@Tceq.Texas.Gov> 
Sent: Thursday, October 14, 2021 3:51 PM
To: 
Cc: .
Subject: RE: Natural Dairy Land Growers; 14-2814C RFI
 
Mr. George,
 
The off-channel reservoir in question was mentioned under the proposed purpose column in Worksheet 1.
 
 

 
Regards,
 
 
Joshua Schauer
Project Manager



TCEQ, Water Rights Permitting Section
 
 

From: R  
Sent: Wednesday, October 13, 2021 11:50 AM
To: Joshua Schauer <Joshua.Schauer@Tceq.Texas.Gov>
Cc: 
Subject: RE: Natural Dairy Land Growers; 14-2814C RFI
 
Mr. Schauer, I’m confused on #1--Off Channel Storage wasn’t proposed as part of this application.
 
I will get a check for the additional fees and submit it.
 
Thanks,
Richard
 

From: Joshua Schauer <Joshua.Schauer@Tceq.Texas.Gov> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 13, 2021 11:17 AM
To: 

 RFI
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of Enviro-Ag Engineering. Do not click links or open attachments unless you have
verified the sender and know the content is safe.

 
Mr. George,
 
Please review the attached RFI letter for the referenced application. A response is requested by 11/12/2021.
 
Feel free to contact me with any questions.
 
Regards,
 
Joshua Schauer
Project Manager
TCEQ, Water Rights Permitting Section
512.239.1371
 
 

Disclaimer

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the
recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure,
copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful.

This email has been scanned for viruses and malware, and may have been automatically archived by Mimecast Ltd, an
innovator in Software as a Service (SaaS) for business. Providing a safer and more useful place for your human
generated data. Specializing in; Security, archiving and compliance. To find out more Click Here.

Disclaimer



The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the
recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure,
copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful.

This email has been scanned for viruses and malware, and may have been automatically archived by Mimecast Ltd, an
innovator in Software as a Service (SaaS) for business. Providing a safer and more useful place for your human
generated data. Specializing in; Security, archiving and compliance. To find out more Click Here.



 

Jon Niermann, Chairman 

Emily Lindley, Commissioner 

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Toby Baker, Executive Director  

 TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service?     tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

  October 13, 2021 
 
 
Mr. Richard George           E-MAIL 
Enviro-Ag Engineering, Inc. 
9855 FM 847 
Dublin, Texas 76446 
 
RE: Natural Dairy Grower Land, LP 
 ADJ 2814 
 CN604321364, RN106506710 

Application No. 12-2814C to Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 12-2814 
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Limited Mailed Notice Required 

 Multiple tributaries of the Leon River and the Leon River, Brazos River Basin 
 Comanche County 
 
Dear Mr. George: 
 
This acknowledges receipt, on August 17, 2021, of the referenced application and fees in the 
amount of $112.50 (Receipt No. M121681, copy attached). 
 
Additional information and fees are required before the application can be declared 
administratively complete. 

1. Provide the location and capacity of the off-channel reservoir described on WORKSHEET 1.0 
including the latitude and longitude in decimal degrees, to at least six decimal places. 

 
2. Remit fees in the amount of $108.78 as described below.  Please make checks payable to 

the TCEQ or Texas Commission on Environmental Quality. 
 

Filing Fee (Amendment) $  100.00 
Recording Fee  
Notice Fee ($2.94 X 37 WR Holders)              

$ 
$ 

     12.50 
108.78 

   
      TOTAL FEES $  221.28 

FEES RECEIVED  $  112.50 
BALANCE DUE $ 108.78 

 
Please submit the requested information and fees by November 12, 2021 or the application may 
be returned pursuant to 30 Texas Administrative Code § 281.18. 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Natural Dairy Grower Land, LP 
Application No. 12-2814C 
October 13, 2021 
Page 2 of 2 
 
If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me via email at 
Joshua.Schauer@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-1371. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
  
Joshua Schauer, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Permitting and Availability Section 
 
Attachment 
 





 

 
Corporate Office: 

3404 Airway Blvd. 

Amarillo TX 79118 

Central Texas: 

9855 FM 847 

Dublin TX 76446 

New Mexico: 

203 East Main Street 

Artesia NM 88210 

 

PHONE: 800-753-6525 www.enviroag.com 

 

8/17/2021                                                                                                                          

TCEQ 
Water Availability Division (MC-160) 
P.O. Box 13087 
Austin, TX 78711-3087 
 
Re: Natural Dairy Grower Land, LP (CN 604321364) 

App. to Amend COA 12-2814 
  
 

To Whom It May Concern, 

Enclosed please find the Amendment Applications for the above referenced permit.  A 
check for $112.50 is enclosed for the required filing & recording fees.  NDGL, LP has a 
pending amendment processing for 118.6 acre feet on the same permit.  This 
amendment is for recently purchased 80 acre-feet on COA 12-2814.  Please call me if 
you have any questions 254-233-9948.  Please submit all correspondence regarding this 
application to me at the Central Texas Office addressed at the top of the page.   

 

Sincerely, 
 

Richard George 
 

Richard George 
Environmental Consultant 
Enviro-Ag. Engineering, Inc. 
 

 

  

 

 

 

















































































































































































































































Attachment D


















































































































































































































































































































