TCEQ Interoffice Memorandum

TO: Office of the Chief Clerk
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality

THRU: Chris Kozlowski, Team Leader
Water Rights Permitting Team

FROM: Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager
Water Rights Permitting Team

DATE: August 15, 2023

SUBJECT: Michael Durrett
WRTP 13916
CN604915173, RN111735338
Application No. 13916 for a Temporary Water Use Permit
Texas Water Code § 11.138, Limited Mailed Notice Required
Alligator Creek, Guadalupe River Basin
Gonzales County

The application and fees were received on May 8, 2023. Additional information and
fees were received on August 8, 2023. The application was declared
administratively complete and accepted for filing with the Office of the Chief Clerk
on August 15, 2023. Limited mailed notice to the downstream water right holders
of record in the Guadalupe River Basin is required pursuant to Title 30 Texas
Administrative Code § 295.154(a).

All fees have been paid and the application is sufficient for filing.

Hal E. Bailey, Jr.”, Préj’ect Manager

Water Rights Permitting Team
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section

OCC Mailed Notice Required Q/ YES O NO

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality



Jon Niermann, Chairman
Emily Lindley, Commissioner
Bobby Janecka, Commissioner

Kelly Keel, Interim Executive Director

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY

Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution

August 15, 2023

Mr. Michael Durrett VIA E-MAIL
276 PR 2002
Gonzales, TX 78629

RE: Michael Durrett
WRTP 13916
CN604915173,RN111735338
Application No. 13916 for a Temporary Water Use Permit
Texas Water Code § 11.138, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice
Alligator Creek, Guadalupe River Basin
Gonzales County

Dear Mr. Durrett:

This acknowledges receipt, on August 8, 2023, of additional information and fees in the
amount of $17.86 (Receipt No. M319637, copy attached).

The application was declared administratively complete and filed with the Office of the
Chief Clerk on August 15, 2023. Staff will continue processing the application for
consideration by the Executive Director.

Please be advised that additional information may be requested during the technical review
phase of the application process.

If you have any questions concerning the application, please contact me via e-mail at
hal.bailey@tceq.texas.gov or at (512) 239-4615.

Sincerely,

Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager

Water Rights Permitting Team
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section

Attachment

P.O.Box 13087 - Austin, Texas 78711-3087 - 512-239-1000 - tceq.texas.gov

How is our customer service? tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey
printed on recycled paper
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Hal Bailey

From: I

Sent: Tuesday, August 8, 2023 10:25 PM

To: Hal Bailey

Subject: Re: Michael Durrett WRTP 13916 Follow-Up Request for Information
Attachments: tceq map and deed.pdf

1. yes, reservoir was constructed and is currently used solely for domestic and livestock purposes 2. yes, water will be
diverted from Alligator Creek 3. yes, coordinates of the diversion point is correct 4. map attached 5. we will use 1/4"
perforated suction hoses when diverting water to ensure aquatic organisms will not be affected by the extraction of
water 6. deed attached 7. am mailing in check for 17.86

Is this okay to answer these questions by email, or do | need to mail in?

Thank you

On 2023-07-12 11:00 am, Hal Bailey wrote:

> Good morning Mr. Durrett,

>

> As we discussed in our telephone call yesterday, attached is a

> follow-up Request for Information (RFI) letter for application no.
> 13916. Please provide the requested additional

>
> information and fees by COB on 08/10/2023.

>

> If you have any questions regarding the letter, please let me know.
>

> Thank you,

>

> Hal E. Bailey, Jr._

>

> Natural Resources Specialist Ill_

>

> _Water Rights Permitting Team_

>

> _Water Availability Division_

>

> Texas Commission on Environmental Quality

>

> 512-239-4615 Hal.Bailey@tceq.texas.gov _
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Warranty Deed with Vendor’s Lien With Mineral Reservations

Natice of confidentiality rights: If you are a natural person, you may remove or strike any
or all of the following [information from any instrument that transfers an interest in real
property before it is filed for record in the public records: your Social Security number or
your driyer’s license qumber.

Da e: September k ['4 2020

Gr tor: Frank A. Vana and Pauline Vana Revocable Living Trust as to 1/2 Interest and
Victor Vana as to 1/2 Interest

Grmntee’s Mailing Address: 276 PR 2002, Gonzales, Texas 78629

Cpnsidera'tion:

Cash and other good
2020 executed by Gra

Grantor’s Mailing Address: WHQH%&M\\ PO 2ok 9271 Mawneyr .—\-:x‘

Grantee: Michael Lee Durrett and Holli Nicole Durrett

»I_I?J[O
D‘-—Ds_h S‘ Cg’/p(.{grq S:'L; LU‘F/",ALAP bz

789

tee and payable to the order of Texas Farm Credit Services, FLCA

q.nd valuable consideration along with a note dated Septemberz_/,b
t of $1,614,300.00 (One Million Six Hundred Fourteen Thousand

Three Hundred and 00/100 Dollars). The note is secured by a first and superior vendor's
lien |and superior title retained in this deed in favor of Texas Farm Credit Services, FLCA
and by a first-lien deed|of trust dated SeptemberZL 2020 from Grantee to Mark A. Miller,

in tFe principal amou

trustee

Prbp rty (including any improvements):

BEING ALL THAT CERTAIN TRACT OF 515, 155 ACRES OF LAND, MORE OR LESS,

LYING AND BEING SITUATED IN GONZALES COUNTY, TEXAS, BEING PART OF
THE GEO&GE W.BARNETTE LEAGUE, ABSTRACT NO. 110, MORE PARTICULARLY
G ALL OF TRACT ONE AND ALL OF TRACT TWO IN TRUSTEE'S SPECIAL

WAR TY DEED DATED NOVEMBER 14, 2003, EXECUTED BY MILES CARLTON
KIN('Y} TO FRANKIE VANA, RECORDED IN VOLUME 898, PAGE 336, OF THE OFFICIAL
RECORDS OF GONZAIES COUNTY, HEREIN CALLED TRACT ONE AND TRACT TWO

NDED TO BE DESCRIBED BY METES AND BOUNDS, WITH
fRID NORTH, AS FOLLOWS: '

NCH IRON ROD SET (ALL IRON RODS SET WITH RED PLASTIC
LES FIRST SHOT SURV) AT THE NORTH CORNER OF SAID

AN EAST CORNER OF A 582 ACRE TRACT OF LAND

)F GIFT DATED JUNE 7, 2011, EXECUTED BY ELMO A.

E M. SAMPLE TO JOHN A . SAMPLE, ET AL., RECORDED IN




VOLUME 1055, PAGE 771, OF THE OFFICIAL RECORDS OF GONZALES COUNTY,
AND IN THE SOUTHWEST LINE OF COUNTY ROAD NO. 119, THE SAME BEING THE
NORTHEAST LINE OF SAID GEORGE W. BARNETT LEAGUE, AND THE SOUTHWEST
LINE OF THE CLARISSA SHERRILL 1280 ACRE SURVEY, ABSTRACT NO. 432, FOR
THE NORTH CORNER DF THIS TRACT OR PARCEL OF LAND HEREBY INTENDED TO
BE DESCRIBED;

THENCE %OUTH 40°48130" EAST ALONG THE NORTHEAST LINE OF SAID TRACT
ONE|AND SAID GEORGE W. BARNETT SURVEY, AND THE SOUTHWEST LINE OF
SAID COUNTY ROAD NO. 119 AND SAID CLARISSA SHERRILL SURVEY, AT 1993.98
FEET, CRQSSING THE EAST CORNER OF SAID TRACT ONE AND THE NORTH
CORNER OF SAID TRAICT TWO, AND CONTINUING ALONG THE NORTHEAST LINE
OF SAID CT TWO, AT 2331.19 FEET, CROSSING THE WEST CORNER OF A 47.235
ACRE CT OF LAND DESCRIBED AS FIRST: SECOND TRACT IN PARTITION DEED
DATED NOVEMBER 17, 1987, EXECUTED BY AND BETWEEN MARY H. DAWE, ET
AL., TO THOMAS S. DAWE, RECORDED IN VOLUME 610, PAGE 731, OF THE
OFFICIAL RECORDS OF GONZALES COUNTY, AND LEAVING SAID COUNTY ROAD
NO. 119 AND CONTINUING ALONG THE SOUTHWEST LINE OF SAID DAWES TRACT,
IN ALL A I#ISTANCE OF 4722.31 FEET TO A 5 /8 INCH IRON ROD FOUND 0.2 FOOT
ABOVE GI}OUND AT THE EAST CORNER OF SAID TRACT TWO, AND A NORTH
CORNER OF A 196.253 ACRE TRACT OF LAND DESCRIBED IN GENERAL

WARRANTY DEED DATED FEBRUARY 25, 2005, EXECUTED BY MAYME A.

GLEGHORN TO J. B. LESTER, RECORDED IN VOLUME 919, PAGE 540, OF THE
OFFICIAL RECORDS OF GONZALES COUNTY, FOR THE EAST CORNER OF THIS
TRACT OR PARCEL OF|LAND HEREBY INTENDED TO BE DESCRIBED;

THENCE SQOUTH 48°52' 6" WEST ALONG THE SOUTHEAST LINE OF SAID TRACT
TWO AND A NORTHWEST LINE OF SAID LESTER TRACT, AT 2415.04 FEET,
CROSSING A TIPPERARY GATHERING PIPELINE, RECORDED IN VOLUME 474, PAGE
505, OF THE GONZALES$ COUNTY DEED RECORDS, IN ALL A DISTANCE OF 3065.57
FEET|TO A|5/8 INCH IRON ROD FOUND 0.5 FOOT ABOVE GROUND AT THE SOUTH
CORNER OF SAID TRACT TWO AND A WEST CORNER OF SAID LESTER TRACT,
AND IN NORTHEART LINE OF A 498.27 ACRE TRACT OF LAND DESCRIBED AS
THIRD TRACT IN SPECIAL WARRANTY DEED DATED DECEMBER 29, 2011,
EXECUTED BY GEORGE GREGORY GRIFFIN » JR. TO JOAN YVONNE GRIFFIN,
TRUSTEE, RECORDED IN VOLUME 1074, PAGE 45, OF THE OFFICIAL RECORDS OF
GONZALEE COUNTY, FOR A SOUTH CORNER OF THIS TRACT OR PARCEL OF LAND
HEREBY INTENDED T( BE DESCRIBED;

TPENCE NORTH 41°07' #4" WEST 2724.18 FEET ALONG THE SOUTHWEST LINE OF
SAID TRACT TWO AND| A NORTHEAST LINE OF AID GRIFFIN TRACT, TO A 5 /8 INCH
IRONROD SET AT THE |WEST CORNER OF SAID TRACT TWO, AND AT A NORTH

.
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of the Property.

Exceptionsto Conveyance and Warranty:

Terms, conditions and stipulations of that certain Oil and Gas Lease dated March 5, 1976,
executed by Thomas E. Hinton and wife, Mary C. Hinton, to Tom Frank Worsham, recorded in
Volume 414, Page 464 of the Deed Records of Gonzales County, Texas covering subject property
for a primary term of 5 year(s).

BN )

Easement for pipe line and appurtenance purposes dated November 6, 1980, executed by Thomas
E. Hinton and wife, Mary Hinton, to Tipperary Gathering, Ltd., recorded in Volume 474, Page

505, of the Deed Records bf Gonzales County, Texas, together with all the terms and provisions
thereof.

Terms and conditions evidenced by the recorded Memorandum of Ground Lease Contract and
Lease for Ground Water dated August 18, 2006, executed by Frankie Vana and Victor Vana, to
Gonzales County Water Supply Corporation, recorded in Volume 949, Page 482, of the Official
Records of Gonzales County, Texas, and subject to the terms and conditions of the Ground Lease
Contract and Lease for Ground Water referenced therein.

Sanitation Maintenance Agreement dated September 8, 2006, by and between Frankie Vana and
Victor Vana, recorded in Violume 950, Page 660, of the Official Records of Gonzales County,
Texas, reference to which jnstrument is hereby made for all purposes. Title to said interest not
researched subsequent to the date of aforesaid instrument.

Terms, conditions and stipylations of that certain Oil and Gas Lease dated October 15, 2008,
executed by Frankie Vana, (to Griffith Land Services, Inc., recorded in Volume 993, Page 304, of
the Official Records of Gonzales County, Texas, covering subject property for a primary term of 3
years.

Ternis, condi,' ons and stipylations of that certain Oil and Gas Lease dated October 15 , 2008,
executed by Victor Vana, tp Griffith Land Services, Inc., recorded in Volume 993, Page 339, of
the Official Records of Gonzales County, Texas, covering subject property for a primary term of 3
years.

Oil and Gas Lease Extensidn Agreement recorded in Volume1076, Page 304, of the Official
Records of Gonzales County, Texas.

Oil and Gas Lease Extension Agreement recorded in Volume 1076, Page 322, of the Official
Recqr s of Gonzales County, Texas.

Unit Designation forming the Tinsley-Vana No. 1H Oil Unit filed for record July 25, 2012,
recorded in Violume 1094, Page 521, of the Official Records of Gonzales County, Texas.

Unit Designation forming the Tinsley No. 1H Oil Unit filed for record October 5 , 2012, recorded
in Volume 1103, Page 382, |of the Official Records of Gonzales County, Texas.

Unit Designation forming the Sample-Vana No. 1H Oil Unit filed for record November 5, 2012,
recorded in |Olume 1106, Rage 352, of the Official Records of Gonzales County, Texas.




|
|
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|
|
Production Gathering, Treating and Processing Agreement dated May 3, 2013, by and between
HPIF Gonzales Holdings) LLC and Forest Oil Corporation, recorded in Volume 1125, Page 7, of

the Official Records of Gpnzales County, Texas, reference to which instrument is hereby made for
all purposes. Title to said interest not researched subsequent to the date of aforesaid instrument.

Amel‘:ded Unit Designatign of the Tinsley-Vana No. 1H Oil Unit filed for record September 5,
20144 recorded in Volumg 1175, Page 388, of the Official Records of Gonzales County, Texas.

Grantor, for the Considergtion, and subject to the Reservations from Conveyance and the
Exceptions to Conveyance and Warranty, grants, sells, and conveys to Grantee the Property,
together with all singular the rights and appurtenances thereto in any way belonging, to have and
to ho{d it to Grantee and (srantee’s heirs, successors, and assigns forever. Grantor binds and to
hold it to Grantee and Grantee’s heirs, successors, and assigns to warranty and forever defend all
and s?ngulair the Property to Grantee and Grantee and Grantee’s heirs, successors, and assigns
against evety person whomsoever lawfully claiming or to claim the same or any part thereof,
except as to the Reservatipns from Conveyance and the Exceptions to Conveyance and
Warranty.

of the purchase price of the Property that is evidenced by the note. The first and superior
vendor’s lien against and superior title to the Property are retained for the benefit of Texas Farm
Crcfdj%t Services, FLCA without recourse against Grantor.

[

Texa% Farm Credit Services, FLCA, at Grantee’s request, has paid in cash to Grantor that portion

The Vendor’s Lien against and Superior Title to the Property are retained until the Note
described is fully paid according to its terms, at which time this Deed will become absolute. The
Vendpr’s Lien and Superipr Title herein retained are hereby transferred, assigned, sold, and
conveyed tq the payee of the Note, and the successors and assigns of the payee.

| When the context fequires, singular nouns and pronouns include the plural.

EXECUTED this LV d
|

Beatrice M, Stoever, Dolores A. Stoever, and Victor V.
Vana, Successor Co-Trustees of the Frank A. Vana and
Paulihe Vana Revocable|Living Trust dated
. September 14, 1998, and any amendments thereto
| T —

y of September, 2020.

; 4] —
By:!wv (R .

. ' Beatrice M. Stoever, Successor Co-Trustee

Dolores A. Stoever, Successor Co-Trustee

L}A.(j%w (J, V Qraes,

i
i
|
|
| Victor V. Vana, individually and as Successor Co-Trustee
|

By:




Hal Bailey

From: Hal Bailey

Sent: Wednesday, July 12, 2023 11:01 AM

To:

Cc: Chris Kozlowski; Humberto Galvan

Subject: Michael Durrett WRTP 13916 Follow-Up Request for Information
Attachments: Michael_Durrett_13916_Follow-Up_RFI_Sent_07.12.2023.pdf

Good morning Mr. Durrett,

As we discussed in our telephone call yesterday, attached is a follow-up Request for Information (RFI) letter for
application no. 13916. Please provide the requested additional
information and fees by COB on 08/10/2023.

If you have any questions regarding the letter, please let me know.
Thank you,

Hal E. Bailey, Jr.

Natural Resources Specialist 11/

Water Rights Permitting Team

Water Availability Division

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality
512-239-4615 Hal.Bailey@tceg.texas.gov




Jon Niermann, Chairman
Emily Lindley, Commissioner
Bobby Janecka, Commissioner

Kelly Keel, Interim Executive Director

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY

Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution

July 12, 2023

Mr. Michael Durrett VIA E-MAIL
276 PR 2002
Gonzales, TX 78629

RE: Michael Durrett
WRTP 13916
CN604915173, RN111735338
Application No. 13916 for a Temporary Water Use Permit
Texas Water Code § 11.138, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice
Alligator Creek, Guadalupe River Basin
Gonzales County

Dear Mr. Durrett:

This is a follow-up to our previous letter dated June 8, 2023 (copy attached) requesting
additional information for the referenced application. To date, a response has not been
received.

Please submit the information requested by August 10, 2023, or the application may be
returned pursuant to Title 30 Texas Administrative Code § 281.18.

If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me via email at
hal.bailey@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-4615.

Sincerely,

Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager
Water Rights Permitting Team
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section

Attachment

P.O.Box 13087 ¢ Austin, Texas 78711-3087 ¢ 512-239-1000 ¢ tceq.texas.gov

How is our customer service? tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey
printed on recycled paper



Jon Niermann, Chairman
Emily Lindley, Commissioner
Bobby Janecka, Commissioner

Erin E. Chancellor, Interim Executive Director

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY

Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution

June 8, 2023

Mr. Michael Durrett VIA E-MAIL
276 PR 2002
Gonzales, TX 78629

RE: Michael Durrett
WRTP 13916
CN604915173, RN111735338
Application No. 13916 for a Temporary Water Use Permit
Texas Water Code § 11.138, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice
Alligator Creek, Guadalupe River Basin
Gonzales County

Dear Mr. Durrett:

This acknowledges receipt, on May 8, 2023, of the referenced application and fees in the
amount of $351.25 (Receipt No. M316507, copy attached).

A temporary permit may only be issued if there is surplus water available for use on a short-
term (temporary or ephemeral) basis in the source supply. During low flow conditions, which
occur during a drought or periods of limited rainfall, all water in the basin will be required for
existing senior water rights and there is no presumption of any surplus flows.

Additional information and fees are required before the application can be declared
administratively complete.

1. Confirm that the reservoir was constructed and is currently used solely for domestic and
livestock purposes.

2. Confirm water will be diverted from Alligator Creek, tributary of Sugar Creek, tributary of
Salty Creek, tributary of Five Mile Creek, tributary of Sandies Creek, tributary of the
Guadalupe River, Guadalupe River Basin.

3. Confirm the coordinates of the diversion point. Staff has calculated the coordinates of the
diversion point to be Latitude 29.373606 ‘N and Longitude 97.584301 “W.

4. Provide a USGS 7.5-minute topographic map (or equivalent) with the location of the
diversion point clearly marked.

5. Indicate the measures the applicant will take to avoid impingement and entrainment of
aquatic organisms (ex. Screens on any new diversion structure that is not already
authorized in a water right). Refer to pages 28-29 from the Instructions for Completing the
Water Right Permitting Application (Form TCEQ-10214A-inst) for assistance in developing
your response.

P.O.Box 13087 ¢ Austin, Texas 78711-3087 ¢ 512-239-1000 ¢ tceq.texas.gov

How is our customer service? tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey
printed on recycled paper



Mr. Michael Durrett
Application No. 13916
June 8, 2023

Page 2 of 2

6. Provide recorded copies of legal documents establishing ownership of the proposed
diversion point or a copy of a duly acknowledged written easement, consent, or license
from the landowner(s) whose land is associated with the proposed diversion point, pursuant
to Title 30 Texas Administrative Code (TAC) § 295.10.

7. Remit fees in the amount of $17.86 as described below. Please make checks payable to the
TCEQ or Texas Commission on Environmental Quality.

Filing Fee (Greater than 10 acre-feet) $ 250.00
Recording Fee ($1.25 x 1 page) $ 1.25
Use Fee ($1.00 x 100 acre-feet) $ 100.00
Notice Fee ($0.94 x 19 WR Holders) $§ 17.86
Total Fees $ 369.11
Fees Received $ 351.25
Fees Due $§ 17.86

Please provide the requested information and fees by July 10, 2023, or the application may be
returned pursuant to Title 30 TAC § 281.18.

If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me via email at
hal.bailey@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-4615.

Sincerely,

Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager
Water Rights Permitting Team
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section

Attachment
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Texas Commission on Environmental Quality
TELEPHONE MEMO TO THE FIILE

Call to: Michael Durrett Call from: Hal E. Bailey, Jr.

Date: July 11, 2023 Project No: WRTP 13916

Information for File follows:
I telephoned Mr. Durrett to follow up on the RFI emailed to him on 06/08/2023. Due date to
provide additional information was 07/10/2023, and to date no response has been received. I left

him a voicemail message requesting a return phone call. (9:22 AM)

Mr. Durrett returned my call and stated that he is working on getting the information together and
would send it as soon as possible. (1:35 PM) I informed him that we will be sending him a follow-

up RFI letter.

Signed:




Hal Bailey

From: I

Sent: Tuesday, July 11, 2023 12:52 PM
To: Hal Bailey
Subject: Re: Michael Durrett WRTP 13916 Request for Information

Sorry this email slipped by us. Yes, we will get that info to you asap.

Thanks,
Holli Durrett

On 2023-06-08 10:24 am, Hal Bailey wrote:

> Good morning Mr. Durrett,

>

> Attached is a Request for Information (RFI) letter for application no.
> 13916. Please provide the requested additional information and fees
> by COB on 07/10/2023.

>

> If you have any questions regarding the letter, please let me know.
>

> Thank you,

>

> Hal E. Bailey, Jr._

>

> Natural Resources Specialist I1l_

>

> Water Rights Permitting Team_

>

> _Water Availability Division_

>

> Texas Commission on Environmental Quality

>

> 512-239-4615 __ Hal.Bailey@tceq.texas.gov__



Hal Bailey

From: Hal Bailey

Sent: Thursday, June 8, 2023 10:24 AM

To:

Subject: Michael Durrett WRTP 13916 Request for Information
Attachments: Michael_Durrett_13916_RFI_Sent_06.08.2023.pdf

Good morning Mr. Durrett,

Attached is a Request for Information (RFI) letter for application no. 13916. Please provide the requested additional
information and fees by COB on 07/10/2023.

If you have any questions regarding the letter, please let me know.
Thank you,

Hal E. Bailey, Jr.

Natural Resources Specialist 11l

Water Rights Permitting Team

Water Availability Division

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality
512-239-4615 Hal.Bailey@tceg.texas.gov




Jon Niermann, Chairman
Emily Lindley, Commissioner
Bobby Janecka, Commissioner
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TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY

Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution

June 8, 2023

Mr. Michael Durrett VIA E-MAIL
276 PR 2002
Gonzales, TX 78629

RE: Michael Durrett
WRTP 13916
CN604915173, RN111735338
Application No. 13916 for a Temporary Water Use Permit
Texas Water Code § 11.138, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice
Alligator Creek, Guadalupe River Basin
Gonzales County

Dear Mr. Durrett:

This acknowledges receipt, on May 8, 2023, of the referenced application and fees in the
amount of $351.25 (Receipt No. M316507, copy attached).

A temporary permit may only be issued if there is surplus water available for use on a short-
term (temporary or ephemeral) basis in the source supply. During low flow conditions, which
occur during a drought or periods of limited rainfall, all water in the basin will be required for
existing senior water rights and there is no presumption of any surplus flows.

Additional information and fees are required before the application can be declared
administratively complete.

1. Confirm that the reservoir was constructed and is currently used solely for domestic and
livestock purposes.

2. Confirm water will be diverted from Alligator Creek, tributary of Sugar Creek, tributary of
Salty Creek, tributary of Five Mile Creek, tributary of Sandies Creek, tributary of the
Guadalupe River, Guadalupe River Basin.

3. Confirm the coordinates of the diversion point. Staff has calculated the coordinates of the
diversion point to be Latitude 29.373606 ‘N and Longitude 97.584301 “W.

4. Provide a USGS 7.5-minute topographic map (or equivalent) with the location of the
diversion point clearly marked.

5. Indicate the measures the applicant will take to avoid impingement and entrainment of
aquatic organisms (ex. Screens on any new diversion structure that is not already
authorized in a water right). Refer to pages 28-29 from the Instructions for Completing the
Water Right Permitting Application (Form TCEQ-10214A-inst) for assistance in developing
your response.
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Mr. Michael Durrett
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6. Provide recorded copies of legal documents establishing ownership of the proposed
diversion point or a copy of a duly acknowledged written easement, consent, or license
from the landowner(s) whose land is associated with the proposed diversion point, pursuant
to Title 30 Texas Administrative Code (TAC) § 295.10.

7. Remit fees in the amount of $17.86 as described below. Please make checks payable to the
TCEQ or Texas Commission on Environmental Quality.

Filing Fee (Greater than 10 acre-feet) $ 250.00
Recording Fee ($1.25 x 1 page) $ 1.25
Use Fee ($1.00 x 100 acre-feet) $ 100.00
Notice Fee ($0.94 x 19 WR Holders) $§ 17.86
Total Fees $ 369.11
Fees Received $ 351.25
Fees Due $§ 17.86

Please provide the requested information and fees by July 10, 2023, or the application may be
returned pursuant to Title 30 TAC § 281.18.

If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me via email at
hal.bailey@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-4615.

Sincerely,

Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager
Water Rights Permitting Team
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section

Attachment
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