
TCEQ Interoffice Memorandum 

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 

TO:   Office of the Chief Clerk 
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 

  
THRU:  Chris Kozlowski, Team Leader 

Water Rights Permitting Team 
  
FROM:  Jenna Rollins, Project Manager 

Water Rights Permitting Team 
  
DATE:  September 15, 2022 
  
SUBJECT:  Donnie R. Watkins and Amy Watkins 

ADJ 1332 
CN605128735, CN605167832, RN102703261 
Application No. 14-1332A to Sever a Portion of Certificate of   

  Adjudication No. 14-1336 and Combine it with and Amend  
  Certificate of Adjudication No. 14-1332 

Texas Water Code § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice 
Concho River, Colorado River Basin 
Tom Green County 

  
The application and partial fees were received on May 4 and May 5, 2022. 
Additional information was received on August 10, 2022, and additional fees were 
received on September 9, 2022. The application was declared administratively 
complete and accepted for filing with the Office of the Chief Clerk on September 15, 
2022. Mailed notice to the interjacent water right holders of record in the Colorado 
River Basin is required pursuant to Title 30 Texas Administrative Code § 
295.158(c)(3)(C). 
 
All fees have been paid and the application is sufficient for filing. 
 
 
 
_________________________ 
Jenna Rollins, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
  
 

 
 

 
OCC Mailed Notice Required    □YES □NO 



Jon Niermann, Chairman 

Emily Lindley, Commissioner 

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Toby Baker, Executive Director 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service? tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

September 15, 2022 
  
Mr. Donnie R. Watkins        VIA E-MAIL 
6486 FM 380 
San Angelo, TX 76905 
  
RE: Donnie R. Watkins and Amy Watkins 

ADJ 1332 
CN605128735, CN605167832, RN102703261 
Application No. 14-1332A to Sever a Portion of Certificate of Adjudication No. 14-1336 

and Combine it with and Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 14-1332 
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice 
Concho River, Colorado River Basin 
Tom Green County 
  

Dear Mr. Watkins:   
 
This acknowledges receipt, on August 10, 2022, of additional information, and on September 9, 
2022, of fees in the amount of $17.64 (Receipt No. M300243, copy attached).  
  
The application was declared administratively complete and filed with the Office of the Chief 
Clerk on September 15, 2022. Staff will continue processing the application for consideration 
by the Executive Director. 
  
Please be advised that additional information may be requested during the technical review 
phase of the application process.  
  
If you have any questions concerning the application, please contact me via email at 
jenna.rollins@tceq.texas.gov or by phone at 512-239-1845. 
  
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
Jenna Rollins, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
 

Attachment 

http://www.tceq.state.tx.us/




 Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
TELEPHONE MEMO TO THE FIILE 

 
Call to:  Mr. Donnie Watkins 

 

Call from: Jenna Rollins 

 

Date: 9/2/22 Project No: 14-1332A 

 

Information for File follows: 

A phone call was made to Mr. Watkins to discuss the remaining fees owed for his amendment 

application No. 14-1332A.  

 

 

 

 

Signed: Date: 9/2/22 
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Jenna Rollins

From: Donnie Watkins 
Sent: Friday, September 2, 2022 5:15 PM
To: Jenna Rollins
Subject: Re: Donnie and Amy Watkins, 14-1332A 

We can not find where it has been cashed. It was was sent but not returned. We are sending a new check in the 
morning. Have a good weekend. Thank you 

Sent from my iPhone 
 
 

On Sep 2, 2022, at 3:59 PM, Jenna Rollins <Jenna.Rollins@tceq.texas.gov> wrote: 

  
Good afternoon Mr. Watkins,  
  
Per our phone conversation, the check for the fees can be sent to the address below: 
  

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality  
Water Availability Division 
P.O. Box 13087, MC-160 
Austin, Texas 78711-3087 

  
If you have any additional questions please let me know. I will touch base with you again on Tuesday, 
September 6, 2022, as we discussed.  
  
Best regards, 
Jenna Rollins, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
512-239-1845 
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Jenna Rollins

From: Jenna Rollins
Sent: Thursday, August 11, 2022 9:10 AM
To: Amy Watkins
Subject: RE: Donnie and Amy Watkins, 14-1332A
Attachments: Donnie and Amy Watkins 14-1332A WS 1.0.pdf

Good morning Ms. Watkins,  
 
Please send the check for the remaining fees to the following address: 
 

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality  
Water Availability Division 
P.O. Box 13087, MC-160 
Austin, Texas 78711-3087 

 
Also, per Mr. Watkins’ request, please see the attached Worksheet 1.0 that was submitted with the original application.  
 
If you have any further questions, please let me know.  
 
Best regards,  
Jenna Rollins, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
512-239-1845 
 
 

From: Amy Watkins   
Sent: Wednesday, August 10, 2022 5:11 PM 
To: Jenna Rollins <Jenna.Rollins@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: FW: Donnie and Amy Watkins, 14-1332A 
 
 
 
Sent from Mail for Windows 10 
 

From: Amy Watkins 
Sent: Wednesday, August 10, 2022 5:06 PM 
To: Donnie Watkins 
Subject: RE: Donnie and Amy Watkins, 14-1332A 
 
Hi Jenna, I think I can answer these three questions. In question 1. The total diversion amount should be 88.1 acre feet. 
In question 2. It would be to irrigate the 27 acre field out of a total 39.023 Acres. No additional land is requested. 3. Can 
you provide me the address to send the check for the additional $17.64 please. Thank you, Donnie Watkins 
 
Sent from Mail for Windows 10 
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From: Donnie Watkins 
Sent: Wednesday, August 10, 2022 4:36 PM 
To: Amy A 
Subject: Fwd: Donnie and Amy Watkins, 14-1332A 
 
 

Sent from my iPhone 
 
Begin forwarded message: 

From: Jenna Rollins <Jenna.Rollins@tceq.texas.gov> 
Date: August 10, 2022 at 1:53:05 PM CDT 
To: Donnie Watkins  
Subject: Donnie and Amy Watkins, 14-1332A 

  
Dear Mr. Watkins,  
  
Please see the attached request for information letter for your amendment application, Donnie and 
Amy Watkins, application No. 14-1332A.  
  
Best, 
Jenna Rollins, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
512-239-1845 
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Jenna Rollins

From: Amy Watkins 
Sent: Wednesday, August 10, 2022 5:11 PM
To: Jenna Rollins
Subject: FW: Donnie and Amy Watkins, 14-1332A

Sent from Mail for Windows 10 

From: Amy Watkins 
Sent: Wednesday, August 10, 2022 5:06 PM 
To: Donnie Watkins 
Subject: RE: Donnie and Amy Watkins, 14-1332A 

Hi Jenna, I think I can answer these three questions. In question 1. The total diversion amount should be 88.1 acre feet. 
In question 2. It would be to irrigate the 27 acre field out of a total 39.023 Acres. No additional land is requested. 3. Can 
you provide me the address to send the check for the additional $17.64 please. Thank you, Donnie Watkins 

Sent from Mail for Windows 10 

From: Donnie Watkins 
Sent: Wednesday, August 10, 2022 4:36 PM 
To: Amy A 
Subject: Fwd: Donnie and Amy Watkins, 14-1332A 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Jenna Rollins <Jenna.Rollins@tceq.texas.gov> 
Date: August 10, 2022 at 1:53:05 PM CDT 
To: Donnie Watkins  
Subject: Donnie and Amy Watkins, 14-1332A 

Dear Mr. Watkins, 

Please see the attached request for information letter for your amendment application, Donnie and 
Amy Watkins, application No. 14-1332A.  

Best, 
Jenna Rollins, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
512-239-1845



Jon Niermann, Chairman 

Emily Lindley, Commissioner 

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Toby Baker, Executive Director 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service? tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

 

August 10, 2022 
   

Mr. Donnie Watkins                                                                        VIA-EMAIL  
6486 FM 380 
San Angelo, TX 76905 
  
RE: Donnie Watkins and Amy Watkins  

ADJ 1332 
CN605128735, CN605167832, RN102703261 
Application No. 14-1332A to Sever a Portion of Certificate of Adjudication No. 14-1336 

and Combine it with and Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 14-1332 
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice 
Concho River, Colorado River Basin   
Tom Green County 
  

Dear Mr. Watkins:  
  
This acknowledges receipt, on May 2, 2022, of the referenced application and fees in the 
amount of $212.50 (Receipt No. M216820, copy attached). 
  
Additional information and fees are required before the application can be declared 
administratively complete.   
 
1. Clarify the total amount of water to be diverted. Certificate of Adjudication (COA) No. 14-

1332 authorizes the Applicant to divert and use not to exceed 24 acre-feet of water per 
year. COA No. 14-1336 authorizes the Applicant to divert and use not to exceed 64.1 acre-
feet of water per year. Applicant seeks to sever their portion of COA No. 14-1336 and 
combine it with their rights under COA No. 1332 for a combined total of 88.1 acre-feet per 
year. Staff notes that Worksheet 1.0 lists the diversion amount as 64.1 acre-feet. 
 

2. Confirm the amount of land to be irrigated. Staff notes that the application is requesting to 
irrigate 27 acres out of a 40-acre tract; however, deeds submitted with the application cover 
a total of 39.023 acres in the W.R. Hausmann Survey 154, Abstract No. 347, and the J. 
Beekman Survey 155, Abstract No. 56.  
 
Provide a recorded copy of the deed(s) for any additional land to be irrigated. The deed 
should include the legal description of the land (metes and bounds). Please note that the 
application must be in the name(s) of all landowners as shown on the deeds; otherwise, 
proper consent of the application must be provided pursuant to Title 30 Texas 
Administrative Code (TAC) § 295.32(a)(5). 

 
 
 
 
 
 

http://www.tceq.state.tx.us/


Mr. Donnie Watkins 
Application No. 14-1332A 
August 10, 2022 
Page 2 of 2 
 

   
 

3. Remit fees in the amount of $17.64 as described below. Please make the check payable to 
the TCEQ or Texas Commission on Environmental Quality.  

 
Filing Fee (Amendment x 2 Water Rights)  $ 200.00 
Recording Fee ($1.00 x 10 pages)   $   12.50 
Notice Fee ($2.94 x 6 Water Rights)   $   17.64 
TOTAL FEES      $ 230.14 
FEES RECEIVED     $ 212.50 
TOTAL FEES DUE     $   17.64 
 

Please provide the requested information and fees by September 9, 2022 or the application may 
be returned pursuant to 30 TAC § 281.18.  
 
If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me via email at 
jenna.rollins@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-1845.  
 
  
Sincerely,  
  
 
 
Jenna Rollins, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section  
 
Attachment 
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